
Día Horario Nombre de Actividad Duración 

DÍA 1 LUN 09/10 

Mañana 

Back Stage Tour Radio City Music Hall: Discover the inner 
workings of one of the world's most iconic entertainment 
venues with a backstage tour of Radio City Music Hall. Explore 
the behind-the-scenes technology and production that goes 
into creating the stunning visual effects and sound design of 
the venue's legendary shows. Learn from seasoned 
professionals and see firsthand how a major production 
facility operates. This exclusive opportunity is not to be 
missed for anyone pursuing a career in the entertainment 
industry. Gain invaluable insights into the world of live 
production! 

01:15 

Tarde 

MasterClass: A Broadway stage manager or set 
designer discusses the technical execution of a director’s 
vision and the collaborative process of lighting and designing a 
set for a professional production. 

01:30 

Tarde 
Tour locaciones de Cine y TV: Visit over 30 TV and film 
locations in New York's East Village or Central Park on this 
guided walking tour.  

02:30 

Noche 

Talkback + Broadway Show:  Before your group arrives to 
your show, a professional actor will greet you and speak with 
your group for approximately twenty minutes. It is a sharing 
of information; an introduction to Broadway, a personal 
sharing of their experiences and a little behind the scenes 
preparation for the show you'll be seeing. Broadway Show 
Tickets included. Beetlejuice, Moulin Rouge or similar. 

03:00 

DÍA 2 MAR 
10/10 

Mañana 

Movie Studios Tour: Get an insider's look into the magic of 
filmmaking with a tour of a New York City movie studio. Step 
onto iconic sets, see behind-the-scenes production 
technology, and learn from experienced professionals in the 
industry. Whether you're an aspiring actor, filmmaker, or 
producer, this tour is the perfect opportunity to gain valuable 
insights and network with like-minded individuals. Don't miss 
this unique chance to witness movie-making history in the 
making. 

03:00 

Tarde 

Inside an Entertainment Company: Experience the heart of 
the entertainment industry with a tour of a top New York City 
entertainment company. Explore the innovative offices of 
industry leaders, and gain valuable insights into the Business 
of movies, television, and more. This exclusive opportunity is 
perfect for aspiring filmmakers, producers, and actors looking 
to network and gain a deeper understanding of the industry. 
Don't miss this chance to learn from experienced 
professionals.  

02:00 



Tarde 

Museum of Broadway Tour: is an interactive and experiential 
museum that celebrates Broadway's rich history, the behind-
the-scenes and its game changers. See hundreds of rare 
costumes, props and artifacts up close and experience 
Broadway like never before. 

01:30 

Noche 

Talkback + Broadway Show:  Before your group arrives to 
your show, a professional actor will greet you and speak with 
your group for approximately twenty minutes. It is a sharing 
of information; an introduction to Broadway, a personal 
sharing of their experiences and a little behind the scenes 
preparation for the show you'll be seeing. Broadway Show 
Tickets included. Back to The Future, Harry Potter  or similar. 

Night 

DÍA 3 MIE 11/10 

Mañana 

Moving Image Museum Guided tour: Explore highlights of the 
Museum’s core exhibition on a guided tour with a Museum 
Educator. The tour is a one-of-a-kind experience that 
immerses visitors in the creative and technical process of 
making, promoting, and presenting films, televisions, and 
other forms of 
digital entertainment. 

01:00 

Tarde 

NBC Studio Tour or TV Show visit: Discover the magic of 
television production at the NBC Studio Tour in New York! 
Explore the iconic sets of your favorite shows and learn 
behind-the-scenes secrets from industry professionals. Perfect 
for students of film, production, and acting, this tour is a 
must-see for anyone interested in the entertainment industry. 

01:30 

Tarde 

Masterclass: A Broadway or Off-Broadway producer discusses 
what it takes to get a production on Broadway, keep it 
running, and skillfully manage the art of financing a multi-
million-dollar production. 

01:00 

Noche 
Music Show: Experience the best of New York's music scene 
at an iconic venue. Enjoy the energy of live music while 
snacking on delicious bites. 

Night 

DÍA 4 JUE 12/10 

Mañana 

Backstage series or movie set: Experience the thrill of the 
filmmaking process by visiting a movie or TV set in New York. 
As a student of film, production or acting, you'll have the 
opportunity to see firsthand how scenes are crafted and 
executed by a team of professionals. You can observe the 
lighting, sound, camera work, and acting as it all comes 
together to create a story. Witnessing a live set will provide 
valuable insight into the art of filmmaking. 

02:00 

Tarde 
Mayor’s Office in DUMBO: Meeting administrative staff from 
the NY Major Office of Media and Entertainment. Session on 
services provided by NYC for film and tv productions.  

02:00 



 

Tarde 

Meet the Artist:  Meet some of New York´s most gifted artists 
in an intimate setting, where you'll hear the experiences of a 
professional actor, director, choreographer, casting director or 
agent. The artist will discuss the challenges of the business, 
backstage anecdotes and career choices. Past participants 
have included Tony® Award winners, Tony-nominees, and 
actors from current Broadway Shows, Movies or TV Series. 

01:00 

Noche 

Talkback + Broadway Show:  Before your group arrives to 
your show, a professional actor will greet you and speak with 
your group for approximately twenty minutes. It is a sharing 
of information; an introduction to Broadway, a personal 
sharing of their experiences and a little behind the scenes 
preparation for the show you'll be seeing. Broadway Show 
Tickets included. Back to The Future, Harry Potter  or similar. 

Night 

DÍA 5 VIE 13/10 

Mañana 
COMIC CON NEW YORK DAY 1: Experience the ultimate pop 
culture Event at New York Comic Con! Join fellow fans from 
around the world for a weekend of celebrity guests, panels, 

screenings, and exclusive merchandise. Don't miss your 
chance to immerse yourself in the world of comics, movies, TV 
shows, video games, and more. Be a part of the ultimate fan 

experience! 

full day 

Tarde 

Tarde 

Noche 

DÍA 6 SAB 14/10 

Mañana 

Backstage Tour Wicked: is an exclusive behind-the-scenes 
look at WICKED Show. Led by members of the WICKED 
Broadway cast, your guides will take you through the creative 
process of a Broadway show. Includes visit to an elaborate set 
model, costumes, as well as actual props and wigs from the 
show. This concludes with a Q+A session with cast members, 
where you will have the opportunity to find out more about 
show business in general. 

01:30 

Tarde 
COMIC CON NEW YORK DAY 2: Experience the ultimate pop 
culture Event at New York Comic Con! Join fellow fans from 
around the world for a weekend of celebrity guests, panels, 

screenings, and exclusive merchandise. Don't miss your 
chance to immerse yourself in the world of comics, movies, TV 
shows, video games, and more. Be a part of the ultimate fan 

experience! 

full day 

Tarde 

Noche 


